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Two people stranded on an island struggle to survive—and slowly fall in love—in the runaway New
York Times bestseller from the author of the forthcoming novel COVET.

Anna Emerson is a thirty-year-old English teacher desperately in need of adventure. Worn down by the cold
Chicago winters and a relationship that’s going nowhere, she jumps at the chance to spend the summer on a
tropical island tutoring sixteen-year-old T.J.

T.J. Callahan has no desire to go anywhere. His cancer is in remission and he wants to get back to his normal
life. But his parents are insisting he spend the summer in the Maldives catching up on all the school he
missed last year.

Anna and T.J. board a private plane headed to the Callahan’s summer home, and as they fly over the
Maldives’ twelve hundred islands, the unthinkable happens. Their plane crashes in shark-infested waters.
They make it to shore, but soon discover that they’re stranded on an uninhabited island.

At first, their only thought is survival. But as the days turn to weeks, and then months, the castaways
encounter plenty of other obstacles, including violent tropical storms, the many dangers lurking in the sea,
and the possibility that T.J.’s cancer could return. As T.J. celebrates yet another birthday on the island, Anna
begins to wonder if the biggest challenge of all might be living with a boy who is gradually becoming a man.
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From reader reviews:

Vicki Shah:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide On the Island will make you to be
smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you
think this open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they are
often thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate book with you?

Raymond Harris:

Here thing why this specific On the Island are different and reputable to be yours. First of all looking at a
book is good but it depends in the content from it which is the content is as delightful as food or not. On the
Island giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no
reserve that similar with On the Island. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your own eyes about
the thing that will happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually
bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your way home by train. When you are having difficulties in
bringing the paper book maybe the form of On the Island in e-book can be your choice.

Daniel Martin:

Typically the book On the Island has a lot of information on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot
of advantage. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Tom makes some research before write
this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after looking over this book.

Harold Morris:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this On the Island book written by well-
known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who also read the
book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and producing skill only for
eliminate your personal hunger then you still uncertainty On the Island as good book not merely by the cover
but also by the content. This is one guide that can break don't assess book by its include, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said
so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.
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