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John Locke described the mind as a cabinet; Robert Hooke called it a repository; Joseph Addison imagined a
drawer of medals. Each of these philosophers was an avid collector and curator of books, coins, and cultural
artifacts. It is therefore no coincidence that when they wrote about the mental work of reason and
imagination, they modeled their powers of intellect in terms of collecting, cataloging, and classification.

The Mind Is a Collection approaches seventeenth- and eighteenth-century metaphors of the mind from a
material point of view. Each of the book's six chapters is organized as a series of linked exhibits that speak to
a single aspect of Enlightenment philosophies of mind. From his first chapter, on metaphor, to the last one,
on dispossession, Sean Silver looks at ways that abstract theories referred to cognitive ecologies—systems
crafted to enable certain kinds of thinking, such as libraries, workshops, notebooks, collections, and gardens.
In doing so, he demonstrates the crossings-over of material into ideal, ideal into material, and the ways in
which an idea might repeatedly turn up in an object, or a range of objects might repeatedly stand for an idea.
A brief conclusion examines the afterlife of the metaphor of mind as collection, as it turns up in present-day
cognitive studies. Modern cognitive theory has been applied to the microcomputer, and while the object is
new, the habit is as old as the Enlightenment.

By examining lived environments and embodied habits from 1660 to 1800, Silver demonstrates that the
philosophical dualism that separated mind from body and idea from thing was inextricably established
through active engagement with crafted ecologies.
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Brumfield:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great along with important the book The Mind Is a Collection: Case
Studies in Eighteenth-Century Thought (Material Texts). All type of book would you see on many sources.
You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Kenny Hardy:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This The Mind Is a Collection: Case Studies in Eighteenth-Century Thought
(Material Texts) book is readable by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the facts here are
arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want
to offer to you. The writer connected with The Mind Is a Collection: Case Studies in Eighteenth-Century
Thought (Material Texts) content conveys objective easily to understand by many individuals. The printed
and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different in the form of it. So , do you nonetheless
thinking The Mind Is a Collection: Case Studies in Eighteenth-Century Thought (Material Texts) is not
loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Tina McKinney:

This book untitled The Mind Is a Collection: Case Studies in Eighteenth-Century Thought (Material Texts)
to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book you can
get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order
it by way of online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book,
as you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this
reserve from your list.

Jean Fair:

Beside that The Mind Is a Collection: Case Studies in Eighteenth-Century Thought (Material Texts) in your
phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the
knowledge you can got here is fresh through the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an old people
live in narrow town. It is good thing to have The Mind Is a Collection: Case Studies in Eighteenth-Century
Thought (Material Texts) because this book offers for you readable information. Do you often have book but
you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this within your
hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island.
Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book as well as read it from now!
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