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EVERY CHOICE HAS A CONSEQUENCE
Once again, the world is on the brink of momentous change. As revolutionary organization Saoirse prepares
to battle the government for control of Earth and Novo, Ariana and those she loves must join humanity's
fight for justice and freedom.

As haunted memories resurface, old discoveries and new realities conspire to shatter her world forever.

Torn in one direction by her unique connection to childhood sweetheart Zane, and pulled in the other by a
relentless passion for her fiery fiancé Cal, she must make the hardest decision of all. While embarking on a
road to self-discovery, her psychic gift evolves and the full extent of her powerful ability is revealed.

Then fate lands another savage blow and she faces the most horrific choice of all. Forced into striking a deal
with the enemy, she must make the ultimate personal sacrifice or risk everything she holds dear.

When destiny finally rears its head, what will the future hold?

Over 550 Five and Four-Star ratings for the series on Goodreads. This is a fully completed series. 

PRAISE FOR DESTINY RISING

"It was beyond brilliant - totally unputdownable, wildly entertaining, edge of the seat action, full of
suspense; it totally rocked." Karla. Goodreads Reviewer.

"This series shows how a love triangle can be done right. Destiny Rising evoked so many emotions in me ...
and the ending, wow, so powerful." Lola. Lola's Book Reviews.

"I cannot believe all of the whammy that this author packed into her book. It's insane how quickly she's put
out these three books, and the quality is so incredibly good." Danielle. Paraeducator and Goodreads
Reviewer.
 
"The events in this book, especially the ones I thought I could handle, left my heart and mind racing."
Khayzelle. Written Arts Blog.
 
"Suspense, and the urge to turn the page were almost overwhelming, resulting in quite a few long
nights." Patricia Hamill. Author @PatriciaHamill2
 
"I cannot put my love for Siobhan Davis' True Calling series into words - it's easily one of my favorite series.
What a fantastic ride..." Danielle. RamblingB00ks Blog.

"This series deserves to become as well-known as popular series such as The Hunger Games, Divergent,
etc... It's that good." Rose. Paranormal Books Blog.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Owens:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are reading whatever
they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like reading
through a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you should have this Destiny Rising (True Calling Book 3).

Garnet Veach:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold
on guys this aren't like that. This Destiny Rising (True Calling Book 3) book is readable by you who hate
those straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience
without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer regarding Destiny
Rising (True Calling Book 3) content conveys prospect easily to understand by many individuals. The
printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different such as it. So , do you even now
thinking Destiny Rising (True Calling Book 3) is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Judy Finley:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want sense
happy read one with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Destiny Rising (True Calling
Book 3) is kind of publication which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Helen Hanson:

Typically the book Destiny Rising (True Calling Book 3) will bring someone to the new experience of
reading any book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to
see, this book very suitable to you. The book Destiny Rising (True Calling Book 3) is much recommended to
you to read. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can easier to read the book.
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